Jasper County, Iowa

Joe Brock

Denny Carpenter

Doug Cupples



Board of Supervisors Courthouse PO Box 944 Newton IA 50208 Phone 641-792-7016 Fax 641-792-1053

JASPER COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS AGENDA

www.co.jasper.ia.us February 21, 2017 9:30 a.m.

Item 1	Engineer – Russ Stutt a) Approve Miscellaneous Steel Purchases for Bridges
Item 2	Human Resources – Dennis Simon a) Employee Hiring Resolution - Maintenance
Item 3	Resolution Approving Transfer # 1372
Item 4	Set Public Hearing for FY17/18 Budget Hearing (Recommended date March 7, 2017 at 9:30am)
Item 5	Approval of Board of Supervisors minutes for 02/14/17
Item 6	Board Appointments

PUBLIC INPUT & COMMENTS

1:00 pm Public Hearing – Secondary Roads Five Year Road Plan

ebruary 21, Steel Quotes for Secondary Roads	condary Roa	ads			len Enterprises		Skyline Steel		Husker Steel
	İtem		Quantity	Price Per	Oc	Price Per	And the second s	Price Per	Comment of the comment of the property of the comment of the comme
10"X 42# X 45'	H-PILE	Grade A572 Gr. 50	70	\$ 774.93	\$ 54,245.10	\$ 731.25	731.25 \$ 51,187.50	\$ 754.00	\$ 52,780.00
12" X 79# X 50'	U-Pile	Grade A992 Gr. 50	13	\$ 1,882.97 \$	\$ 24,478.61	\$ 2,031.50	\$ 26,409.50	No Bid	\$
8 Gage 45 Foot Sheet Piling	eet Piling		20	\$ 378.00 \$	\$ 7,560.00	\$ 400.95	\$ 8,019.00	No Bid	•
Steel Girder Bridge Superstructure for a 70' X 24'-6" deck on a 0° skew	Superstruct	ture	P	\$ 56,755.73	\$ 56,755.73	No Bid		No Bid	A STATE OF THE STA
delivered on site. A plan drawing signed by a Licensed Engineer must	\ plan drawir ed Engineer r	ng must	nanceure of enter		and the second s	Commission and Confederation of the Confederation o			The Company of the Co
accompany the quote.	ote.		andres Cal. 4	To constant of the constant of					# # # # # # # # # # # # # # # # # # #

Resolution 17-

WHEREAS, a position vacancy has been approved for the following appointment by the Board of Supervisors through the Personnel Requisition Process.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED that the Board of Supervisors approves and certifies the following appointment to the Auditor for payroll implementation:

DEPARTMENT	POSITION	EMPLOYEE	PAY RATE	RANGE/STEP	EFFECTIVE DATE
Maintenance Department	Maintenance Technician	Andrew Main	\$17.93 Non-progressive Scale	Hire-In	2/27/17

Resolution adopted this 21st day of February, 2017

	Joe Brock, Chairman	
itest:		

RECORDED IN BOARD OF SUPERVISORS MINUTES BOOK 21 2/21/17 PAGE

Resolution					
STATE OF IOWA }]	RANSFER ORDER Newton, Iowa, <u>February 21, 2017</u>	\$1,223,771.85			
Doug Bishop, Treasurer, Jasper Count	y, Iowa				
Fransfer One million two hundred twenty three thousand seven hundred seventy one dollars and 85/100***dollars					
From: 0011 - Rural Services To: 0020 - Secondary Roads Fund Fund					
xxxx-99-0051-000-81400	xxxx-99-0051-000-81400				
Account of: Road Use Funds Match By Ord	Account of: Road Use Funds Match By Order of Board of Supervisors.				
		Auditor			
NO. 1372	Teresa Anonda	Deputy			

This transfer is required in order to receive State Road Use Funds.

Transfer for General Fund: periods 1-3 \$110,321.38

Transfer for Rural Services: period 1-3 \$1,113,450.47

Tuesday, February 14, 2017 the Jasper County Board of Supervisors met in regular session at 9:30 a.m. with Supervisors Brock, Carpenter and Cupples present and accounted for; Chairman Brock presiding.

Kelsey Ford asked the Board to approve a driveway variance located at 555 W 68th St S. Newton Iowa. The County Engineer recommended against the variance.

Motion by Cupples, seconded by Carpenter to disallow the driveway variance located at 555 W 68th St S Newton, Iowa, made by Chris and Kelsey Ford.

YEA: CARPENTER, BROCK, CUPPLES

Treasurer Doug Bishop asked the Supervisors to approve abatements for junked mobile home taxes located in Monroe and Colfax.

Motion by Carpenter, seconded by Cupples to approve the following abatements for junked mobile home taxes:

Monroe Mob	ile Home Parl	k	Colfax Mobile Hom	e Park	
VIN	LOT	BASE TAX	VIN	LOT	BASE TAX
26971	27	\$186	3424072381	21	\$360
4248	25	\$ 50	KAFL1A701450236	5 5	\$296
LK4009	18	\$222	45599	27	\$624
2170	5	\$466	49340X	11	\$740
N038275	28	\$814	46424	6	\$1,036
06L24947	36	\$1,332			
62236	17	\$1,350			
02561278H	10	\$1,950			
TOTAL		\$6,370	TOTAL		\$3,056

YEA: CUPPLES, CARPENTER, BROCK

Motion by Cupples, seconded by Carpenter to approve a 2.75% salary increase for the Auditor, County Attorney, Recorder, Sheriff and Treasurer.

YEA: CARPENTER, CUPPLES, BROCK

Motion by Cupples, seconded by Carpenter to approve a 1.99% salary increase for the County Supervisors.

YEA: CARPENTER, CUPPLES, BROCK

Motion by Brock, seconded by Carpenter to approve Resolution 17-08 establishing the following salaries for the County Elected Officials for FY2017-2018:

Auditor	\$ 72,504.51	2.75%
County Attorney	\$115,555.73	2.75%
Recorder	\$ 72,504.51	2.75%

Sheriff	\$106,964.81	2.75%
Supervisors	\$ 42,019.88	1.99%
Treasurer	\$ 72,504.51	2.75%

YEA: CUPPLES, CARPENTER, BROCK

A copy of the resolution is on file in the Office of the Jasper County Auditor.

A discussion was held about the condition of the County Annex Building. It was stated that the engineering firm Shive – Hattery had estimated that it would take \$650,000 to repair the building. Some of the issues with the building include the foundation, HVAC problems, window wells and stairways. The Supervisors are going to look into either repairing the Annex Building or relocating to another facility.

Motion by Carpenter, seconded by Cupples to approve the Supervisors minutes for 02/07/2017.

YEA: CUPPLES, CARPENTER, BROCK

There were no Board appointments.

Motion by Carpenter, seconded by Cupples to adjourn the Tuesday, February 14, 2017 meeting of the Jasper County Board of Supervisors.

YEA: CUPPLES, CARPENTER, BROCK

Dennis K. Parrott, Auditor	Joe Brock, Chairman